
Altius Sports has successfully installed landscape turf in
prestigious projects all over India. Here, we showcase a project that
has given us yet another chance to show our excellence and
creativity in the landscape genre. 

In this project, Altius Sports has left its unique footprint on each
floor of this private residence by offering different landscaping
designs across the various floors. 

Private Residence
Kolkata, WB

Supply and installation of TigerTurf landscape turf along with
shock-cum-drain pad

Date of project completion: December, 2022

Surface:TigerTurf Sierra 35 & TigerTurf Sine pad

The turf is UV stabilised, thus ensuring your lawn will look lush,
green and last for years and years. This green with beige thatched
means that this product gives a realistic impression of recently
mowed, fresh grass always. And what is more – no watering, mowing
or weeding required.

The landscape turf was installed on a TigerTurf Sine Pad. This
ensures both shock-absorption as well as fantastic drainage. It
provides a comfortable, cushioning surface making it easier on
joints and muscles and helps reduce wear on the back of the tufts of
the carpet – thus increasing the wear and longevity of the turf itself.
With the added drainage feature, you never need to give the turf a
moment’s rest and can enjoy the outdoors indoors, 24 x 7, 365 days
a year. With TigerTurf landscape, the grass is actually greener where
you stand!

Base construction: Concrete

TigerTurf Sierra 35 was the choice here and laid on a TigerTurf Sine
Pad. Naturally, our TenCate yarn is certified across continents in
terms of being “truly green” be it US Pro 65 or European Reach
standards. This soft, lush, appealing turf is also EN71-3 certified –
which means safe as a toy and great for kids and pets alike.


